
 

Course Overview  
UETDREL006 Work safely in the vicinity of live 
electrical apparatus as a non-electrical worker 
 

Description 

This course covers compliance with working 
safely up to the defined “safe approach 
distance” near energised electrical apparatus 
(inc. electrical powerlines) for non-electrical 
workers. 
The work functions that would benefit from this 
training include plant operators, painters, 
vegetation control, riggers, scaffolders and other 
persons that need to work safely and comply 
with requirements and established procedures 
near live electrical infrastructure.  

Delivery mode 

Training and assessment occurs in a classroom 
environment. 

Pre-requisites 

 CPCCWHS1001 Prepare to work safely in 

the construction industry (TasNetworks 

requirement) 

 Literacy and numeracy skills as described 

in the Learner Handbook (TasNetworks 

requirement) 

Certification 

On successful completion, participants will 
receive a Statement of Attainment for 
UETDREL006 Work safely in the vicinity of live 
electrical apparatus as a non-electrical worker. 

 

 

 

Course Content 

 Electrical terminology, transmission and 
distribution voltages 

 Established procedures and safe approach 
distances  

 Risk assessments, control measures and the role 
of safety observers 

Course Location and Dates 

Click here for upcoming dates, availability and to enrol 

 

Courses are held at the following locations: 

 TasNetworks Training Centre, 8 Mornington 
Road, Mornington 

 TasNetworks Rocherlea Depot, 1 Australis 
Drive, Rocherlea 

 TasNetworks Devonport Depot, 162 Middle 
Road, Devonport 

 

Contact 
TasNetworks Training Centre 

P | 03 6271 6111 

E | training@tasnetworks.com.au 

www.tasnetworks.com.au 
8 Mornington Road 7018 

PO Box 606, Moonah TAS 7009 

Registered Training Organisation 1128 

8 
Hours 

8-10 
People 

$400 
GST Free 

https://enrol.vetenrol.com.au/?clientID=VT-TASNET
mailto:training@tasnetworks.com.au

